Ordinance No. 2415

CITY OF CONCORD

@Z@%@WO/GW%@/@@WW%{M-

AN ORDINANCE amending the number of City Council members appointed to the Economic
Development Advisory Council, Recreation and Parks Advisory Committee,
Community Development Advisory Committee, and Public Safety Board.

@The Tity of Concord ordains as follofs:

SECTIONI:  Amend the CODE OF ORDINANCES, Title V, Administrative Code, Chapter 30,
Administrative Code, Article 30-3, Boards and Commissions, Section 30-3-16, Economic
Development Advisory Council, subsection (a), by deleting the words “eleven (11) members: three
(3) members of the City Council” and replacing with the words “twelve (12) members: four (4)
members of the City Council” so that the first portion of subsection (a) reads as follows:

(a) The Economic Development Advisory Council shall consist of twelve (12) members:
four (4) members of the City Council; . . . .

SECTIONII:  Amend the CODE OF ORDINANCES, Title V, Administrative Code, Chapter 30,
Administrative Code, Article 30-3, Boards and Commissions, Section 30-3-23, Recreation and Parks
Advisory Committee, subsection (a), by amending the following;

1. Amend subsection (a), first sentence, by deleting the words “thirteen (13) members”
and replacing with the words “fourteen (14) members” so that the first sentence of subsection (a)
reads as follows:

(a) The Recreation and Parks Advisory Committee shall consist of fourteen (14)
members.

2 Amend subsection (a)(4), by deleting the words “One City Councilor” and replacing
with the words “Two City Councilors™ so that subsection (a)(4) reads as follows:

(4) Two City Councilors to be appointed by the Mayor.
SECTION III: Amend the CODE OF ORDINANCES, Title V, Administrative Code, Chapter 30,

Administrative Code, Article 30-3, Boards and Commissions, Section 30-3-24, Community
Development Advisory Committee, by amending the following:



Ordinance No. 2415

CITY OF CONCORD

@Z@M@WO/M%MWW&M

AN ORDINANCE  amending the number of City Council members appointed to the Economic
Development Advisory Council, Recreation and Parks Advisory Committee,
Community Development Advisory Committee, and Public Safety Board.

@he ity of Cancord ardains as follofos:

1. Amend subsection (a) by deleting the words “nine (9) members™ and replacing with
the words “ten (10) members™ so that subsection (a) reads as follows:

(a) The Community Development Advisory Committee shall consist of ten (10) members
to be appointed as follows:

2. Amend subsection (a)(1) by deleting the words “Four (4) members” and replacing
with the words “Five (5) members” so that subsection (a)(1) reads as follows:

(1) Five (5) members of the City Council appointed by the Mayor, as soon as practicable
after the City Council’s biannual organization meeting, to serve a two-year term.

SECTIONIV: Amend the CODE OF ORDINANCES, Title V, Administrative Code, Chapter 30,

Administrative Code, Article 30-3, Boards and Commissions, Section 30-3-25, Public Safety Board,
by amending the following:

1. Amend subsection (a) by deleting the words “nineteen (19) members” and replacing
with the words “twenty (20) members™ so that subsection (a) reads as follows:

(a) The Public Safety Board shall consist of twenty (20) members:

2. Amend subsection (a)(1) by deleting the words “Three (3) members” and replacing
with the words “Four (4) members” so that subsection (a)(1) reads as follows:

(1) Four (4) members of the City Council appointed by the Mayor and approved by the
City Council; one of whom shall be named as Chair by the Mayor.

SECTION V: This ordinance shall take effect upon its passage.

In City Council
February 11, 2002
Passed

_/Jgé/’c e’ ﬁ'ﬂmﬂj/ &’{f

City Clerk



